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After Hazen Wood kidnaps twelve-year-old Gemma Sullivan, the two embark upon a cross-country journey
that tests the limits of Gemma's endurance. In scenes of physical and sexual violence, Hazen tries to destroy
the young girl's will. When she does manage to escape he drags her back and threatens to have her arrested
for the violent acts he performs. It is only Gemma's resilience and fertile imagination that protects her from
the worst of the trauma she suffers. And, in the end, it is the healing power of unconditional love that gives
Gemma the courage to speak out against her abuser at last and claim the life she deserves.

Alternating between the voices of Gemma and Hazen Wood, Meg Tilly has brilliantly brought to life
powerful and unforgettable characters that will leave you thinking about them long after you turn the last
page.
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From reader reviews:

Wayne Ross:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy
individual? If you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And
you have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to
answer that question mainly because just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on
every person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on guardería until university need this Gemma to read.

Luz Davis:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Gemma that give your
fun preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the
opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be mentioned
constantly that reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success
person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you may pick Gemma become your
current starter.

Lily Spivey:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Gemma book written by well-known writer
who really knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written
within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal
hunger then you still question Gemma as good book but not only by the cover but also by the content. This is
one e-book that can break don't judge book by its include, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to one
more sixth sense.

Carl Terrell:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you go through a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Gemma provide you with new experience in looking at a book.
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